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Chatham Kent Chinese Medicine & Acupuncture Clinic -
Chatham

   
Welcome to Chatham Kent Chinese Medicine & Acupuncture Clinic

  At the Chatham Kent Chinese Medicine & Acupuncture Clinic, we focus on
providing exceptional acupuncture therapy to alleviate pain and promote
wellness. Our clinic is conveniently located in Chatham, Ontario, and boasts a
range of **amenities** designed to ensure an enjoyable and accessible
experience for all our patients.  
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Accessibility Features

  We understand the importance of accessibility for all patients. Our clinic offers
a **wheelchair-accessible car park**, ensuring that everyone can reach us
without hassle. Additionally, our facilities include an **accessible toilet**,
allowing for a comfortable visit. We prioritize making our services available to
everyone in the community, regardless of their mobility needs.  

Appointments Recommended

  While walk-ins are welcome, we highly recommend scheduling
**appointments** ahead of time. This approach allows us to better manage our
schedule and provide you with dedicated time to discuss your health concerns
with our skilled acupuncturist, Mario. Many patients have found this beneficial in
receiving personalized care that meets their specific needs.  

Patient Experiences

  The feedback from our patients speaks volumes about our dedication to quality
care. One individual shared their journey of dealing with numbness in their
hands and mentioned how after six sessions with Mario, they began to feel
different sensations—a true testament to the effectiveness of our treatments.
Many patients have echoed similar sentiments, praising Mario’s empathetic
approach and the encouragement received from our staff.  Patients have also
emphasized Mario's expertise in pain management, highlighting how his
treatments often provide relief without the need for medication. One grateful
patient remarked that they were able to avoid back surgery thanks to the
significant improvements experienced during their acupuncture sessions.  

Community Trust and Support

  Our clinic has become a beacon of hope for those seeking natural healing
methods. From pain management to recovery from injuries, the testimonials of
satisfied clients reflect the trust the Chatham community places in our services.
Even those initially hesitant about acupuncture have reported remarkable
success, often feeling better after just one session.  However, we acknowledge
that not every experience has been perfect. Feedback about wait times and
reception service is taken into account as we strive to improve every aspect of
our clinic. We appreciate the input from our clients and work diligently to provide
a welcoming atmosphere.  

Conclusion

  If you are considering acupuncture therapy, we invite you to visit the
**Chatham Kent Chinese Medicine & Acupuncture Clinic**. With our
commitment to accessibility, personalized care, and community well-being, we
are here to help you on your journey to health. Experience the difference at our
clinic, where patience and perseverance lead to lasting results.    
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The location of our premises is

  
 232 St Clair St, N7L 3J7  Chatham, Ontario - Canada  (CA) 
 
     
 
The phone number of the respective Acupuncture clinic  is +1519-351-6539
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1519-351-6539
 
    
 
   
    
 

Visit us during the following hours:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–6?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–6?PM   Wednesday 9?AM–6?PM   Thursday Closed   Friday Closed   Saturday 9?AM–6?PM   Sunday 9?AM–6?PM        The website is Chatham Kent Chinese Medicine & Acupuncture Clinic       If necessary to adjust any detail that you think is not correct regarding this
portal, we urge you to deliver a message so we can we will fix it at the earliest
convenience. With anticipation thanks for your cooperation. 

Images
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